
January 21, 2012    Paynesville City, Liberia   (Soon to be No PainsVille City) 

Open Air Crusade: 

Tony: 

We showed up at the crusade field after numerous setbacks to total darkness and just a few 
(maybe 200 people there). As the praise and worship got cranking (two hours after the 
scheduled start) people kept coming and coming. It seems as though there were many people 
that wouldn’t have been able to come earlier and Our Daddy arranged for the start time to be 
changed. All Glory to God! 

It was demonstration time. Some words of knowledge came forth and I gave a word for 
damaged knees. We watched these women hobble up, receive prayer and then jump. It wasn’t 
just us watching, it was a lot of people that came to see if what they heard about Jesus was 
true. 

I got to pray for a number of women that were barren. It is so much fun to watch as they feel 
their internal parts getting touched. 

Lots of Deliverance tonight.  Night terrors, Demons coming at night and doing strange things to 
women, all sorts of strange events. The power of God came and set one after another free! 

Now this was really cool. A young man came for prayer who had a bike accident. He stopped his 
fall off the bike by landing on his hands. The force of the fall crushed his wrists and they were 
pretty mangled. He basically had no use of his hands. I put my hands around his wrists and 
prayed. I was expecting to feel the bones moving, but felt nothing. Forgetting momentarily that 
the miraculous is miraculous and doesn’t need to be felt, I thought that I would be praying 
again when I took my hand off his wrists. But, amazingly, without me feeling anything happen, 
his wrists were totally put back to normal with bones back in the right places. He freaked when 
he saw what happened as he didn’t feel anything either. Glory to God, He is so amazing! I just 
stood there for a few moments is amazement at what I had just seen. 

  A man that could hardly breathe, looked like he should be in the hospital, spoke of pressure in 
his chest that made living nearly unbearable. He was shaking from this disease, in great fear 
and we could see and feel his concern for his life. In a moment, he felt something (someone) 
leave him with a great release and instantly all pressure was gone and breathing returned to 
normal. Wow, you should have seen this guy, was he ever happy. Thank you, Jesus. 

As you will read from some of the other testimonies, the miraculous healings were fast and 
coming one after another. There were hundreds of miracles and large number of salvations that 
broke loose tonight. No one in the crowd moved, they were all fixed on the constant flow of 
miracle testimonies coming forth and the hooting and hollering of praise from people as they 
were released from their sicknesses. 

Rev. Kettor: 



First of all we appreciate all being so patient with us for the start of the outreach tonight. There 
was a big delay in setting up the instruments and lacks we had BUT I believe was totally on 
time. I believe it was to allow many to come that would have missed it if it was earlier. Many 
came to see if it was real that people are being healed. I was so impressed seeing those that 
came to watch, got healed, those that came to be healed, got healed, those that came to mock, 
got healed, those that didn’t believe got healed. It was amazing as multitudes received 
salvation tonight after witnessing the loving healing power of Jesus! 

The entire crusade tonight centered around a young girl that the whole village knew was deaf 
and dumb for all of her life and when she received her miracle the crowd went wild, screaming 
and yelling praises to Jesus. The people that were all around the back, not wanting to get too 
close, ran to hear this girl talk. They were in amazement and when it came to salvation call 
time, they all came running to Jesus. I was so impressed to see God do this. 

There were a lot of trials before the crusade. A flat tire delayed us for more than an hour. Then 
no car to carry us to the crusade grounds. After all that was fixed we got to the crusade ground, 
there was no power, no lights, no music. We prayed and worked hard to get it ready. Then the 
batteries in the mikes blew up. We will not be taken out, in Jesus Name. With all the obstacles, 
there was breakthrough ahead of us. There was no negativity or speaking the problem, just all 
working together, praising God! 

First, the deaf and dumb girl was born that way. To hear her begin to speak tonight, oh My God, 
what a miracle. 

A lady that had terrible back problems for 30 years and was instantly healed! That was 30 
years! Oh, there were some many healed of back problems. It was so fast, one after another 
after another. 

Many, many people with head and neck disorders and head pains, that were all instantly 
healed. Many with pains that looked like kidney problems were instantly healed. 

A man with crippled leg that was instantly healed and walked away praising God! Many others 
had leg and walking problems, all instantly healed! A young girl was suffering with in her legs 
daily with pain that was instantly healed. 

Many women had stomach disorders for many years and all were instantly healed! There were 
two, one 30 years and one 25 years suffering with this everyday of their life. Gone in a moment! 
Thank you Jesus! 

Many people with back problems instantly healed. Some 10, 15, 20 years of agony. What a joy 
to see them twisting and bending praising God! 

Many with various forms of arthritis all over their bodies; instantly healed! 

Ulcer victims were healed instantly! Amazing to see this. 

Heart problems seemed to instantly disappear, praise God! 



Pastor Instantly Report yet to come:  

Casey: 

Outreach time  this evening was just awesome. I know this word gets overused all the time 
but hey it was awesome tonight. As you already know we got started real late tonight, but that 
didn’t stop God He was there in full power with signs and wonders to boot. After a few words 
on knowledge were given we were off and praying. Right away we know we were in for a great 
night when the first few people being prayed for were healed instantly. It didn’t matter what 
the condition was the healings were just popping. There were a lot of people here tonight and I 
couldn’t even guess as to how many people we prayed for, but it was bunches.  

I prayed for several backaches that the people had the pain for years, but just one touch from 
Jesus and it was gone. The people began to press in for prayer after they saw and heard what 
God was doing in this dirt field. In the middle of the crowd around me I felt the Holt Spirit direct 
me to this teenage girl that was trying to press through the crowd for prayer. So I pointed her 
out and got her to me so I could pray for her. Come to find out she was born deaf and mute. 
Just to say I love to pray for deaf mutes too so this was like a bonus. I placed my hands on her 
ears and began to speak to that deaf spirit and command it to leave her body and speak life and 
sound and healing into her ears and BAM one of her ears popped open right away. If this 
doesn’t get you excited nothing will. Now that she could hear out of one ear I wanted to get her 
to speak so I came against the spirit of muteness and commanded it to go in Jesus name. I 
placed her hand on my throat so she could feel the vibration of my vocal cords as I spoke. Then 
I placed her hand on her throat and had her speak for the first time. Her first word she spoke 
was Jesus. Now one ear was open and she started to speak it was time to go after the other ear 
to get it opened as well.  

Before I could do this Pastor Harris or as you all know him as pastor instantly gave a salvation 
call. We got swamped with so many people wanting to receive Jesus and he said for the people 
to raise their hands while they received salvation. The young girl that I was praying for put her 
hands into the air and prayed for Jesus to come into her life and as soon as she said Jesus her 
other ear popped open all on its own.  

Needless to say she was stoked and once the crowd found out that she could hear and speak 
they went crazy. They all followed her around in amazement of what God did for her. See they 
all knew her and knew she never could hear or speak but in moments of someone praying for 
her she was made whole. Jesus was getting all the glory for this one.  

Right after her a young boy with the same problem wanted prayer too. This took a while for 
both of his ears open, well one popped open right away and I fought for the other one to open. 
Several prayers later it opened and this little guy never gave up he knew after watching the 
teenage girl get healed he was going to get healed as well. He too also started to speak for the 
first time tonight. The last person I prayed for was an older woman in a wheelchair. She was 
totally paralyzed from the waist down. No feeling or movement at all. I wish I could tell you that 
she got up and walked but not yet. However she did get all of the feeling back in both legs all 
the way to the tip of her toes, and she even began to lift her right leg about four inches off the 



foot rest. I even saw all of her toes wiggling to the worship music being played as we were 
praying for her. She was very thankful for the healing process that she has now entered into. I 
guessing she will be walking soon. 


